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VIRGINIA:
AT A REGULAR MEETING OF THE BRUNSWICK COUNTY BOARD OF SUPERVISORS HELD ON WEDNESDAY, NOVEMBER 18, 2009, IN THE AUDITORIUM OF THE COUNTY GOVERNMENT BUILDING 

PRESENT:
BARBARA JARRETT DRUMMOND, CHAIR; ROBERT H. CONNER, MARC L. FINNEY, BERNARD L. JONES, SR., BOARD OF SUPERVISOR MEMBERS; CHARLETTE T. WOOLRIDGE, COUNTY ADMINISTRATOR; TAMMY W. NEWCOMB, CMC, DEPUTY CLERK; 
ABSENT:
WELTON TYLER, BOARD OF SUPERVISOR MEMBER
*****

Re:  Closed Meeting – 6:00 p.m.


Upon motion of Mr. Finney, seconded by Mr. Jones, and unanimously carried, 
the Board of Supervisors convened in Closed Meeting to discuss the following matters:

2.2-3711.A.1
Discussion of a personnel matter.

2.2.3711.A.7

Consultation with legal counsel regarding specific legal matters requiring the provision of legal advice by such counsel, to-wit:

· Republic Services, Inc.  

· Pea Hill Crossing, LLC   

· Camper Trailers – Stay on Enforcement 

· Evans Creek Road Property

MOTION TO RECONVENE IN OPEN MEETING

Upon motion of Mr. Finney, seconded by Mr. Jones, and unanimously carried, 

the Board of Supervisors of Brunswick County, Virginia, reconvened in Open Meeting. 

CERTIFICATION OF CLOSED MEETING DISCUSSION

WHEREAS, the Board of Supervisors of Brunswick County, Virginia (“Board”), convened a Closed Meeting on this date pursuant to an affirmative recorded vote in accordance with the provisions of the Virginia Freedom of Information Act; and, 

WHEREAS, Section 2.2-3712 of the Code of Virginia, 1950, as amended, requires a certification by the Board that such Closed Meeting was conducted in conformity with Virginia law. 


NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the Board hereby certifies that, to the best of each member’s knowledge, (i) only public business matters lawfully exempted from Open Meeting requirements by Virginia law were discussed in the Closed Meeting to which this certification resolution applies, and (ii) only such public business matters as were identified in the motion convening the Closed Meeting were heard, discussed or considered by the Board. 

Ayes:  Conner, Finney, Jones, Drummond; Nays: None. 

*****
Re:
Regular Meeting at 7:00 p.m.

Chair Drummond called the regular meeting to order and welcomed all 
citizens in attendance.   
*****

Re:   Invocation and Pledge of Allegiance
Supervisor Finney gave the Invocation and led the Pledge of Allegiance.

*****

Re:    Approval of Agenda 

Upon motion of Mr. Jones, seconded by Mr. Finney, and unanimously 

carried, the Board approved the agenda with the following changes:

Special Presentations

· Add St. Pauls College Dominion Leadership Development Class

· Add Certificates

Planning Director’s Report 
· Strike Schedule Public Hearing – Conditional Use Permit Case #09-015
Old Business 
· Add Director of Finance position
New Business 

· Add Hotel Study 

Ayes:  Conner, Finney, Jones, Drummond; Nays: None.     

*****

Re:  Approval of Minutes    


Upon motion of Mr. Finney, seconded by Mr. Jones, and carried, the Board 
approved the minutes of the October 8, 2009, Adjourned Meeting and October 21, 

2009, Regular Meeting as recorded.
Ayes: Conner, Finney, Jones, Drummond; Nays:  None

*****
Re:  Virginia Department of Transportation


Mr. Richard Moody, Assistant Resident Engineer, presented the monthly report 
as follows:
Construction Report

· Rural Rustic Program 2009-10

· Route 722 – Wrightwood Drive from Route 611 to end state maintenance 

(working on environmental documents)

Spot Stabilization
· 2008-09 Program – B.P. Short completed projects
· Route 673 – Reavis Gin Road from Route 611 to Route 715 

· Route 712 – Old Stage Road from Route 58 to Route 634

· 2009-10 Program 

· Route 611 – Dry Bread Road from Route 644 to Route 46 

Maintenance Forces 

· Placing stone on various secondary routes around mailboxes and low shoulders and on non-hard surfaced secondary roads; machining non-hard surfaced secondary roads; replacing pipe; and patching and cleaning intersections.   

Secondary and primary mowing as required for safety and site distance. Procuring hired equipment for snow removal. 
Revenue Sharing Program

· Revenue Sharing Program FY09-10, Route 785 Park Place. Application and Resolution approved.  

Turnkey Asset Management for Interstate Maintenance 

· Effective July 1, 2007

· 24/7 Telephone Number – 1-866-378-7743 (Smart Traffic)

*****

Re:  Special Presentations 

St. Paul’s College – Dominion Leadership Class 


Supervisor Finney introduced members of the St. Paul’s College Dominion 

Leadership Class. He stated that as part of their curriculum, students must observe a 

meeting of a local governing body.  The Board of Supervisors welcomed the students. 
*****
Certificates – Board of Supervisor Certification 


Chair Drummond stated that Supervisors Robert H. Conner and Bernard L. 
Jones, Sr. have completed the Board of Supervisors Certification Class administered 
through Virginia Association of Counties. She presented them with Certificates of 

Recognition. The Board members and County Administrator congratulated them for 

earning this esteemed professional achievement. 
*****

Re:  Department/Agency Presentations 

The Improvement Association – Project P.L.E.A.D. – Ginger Wrenn
 
Ms. Ginger Wrenn, The Improvement Association, presented an overview of the 

“Communities that Care Youth Survey” and the projects that the group is participating in

for the Board’s information. 
She thanked the Board of Supervisors for their continued support of this program. 


This was presented for the Board’s information. 

*****
Town of Lawrenceville Generator Update – Mayor Douglas R. Pond 

Mayor Douglas R. Pond stated that the generator project will be completed by
December 9, 2009. The primary purpose of the project is to provide the municipal 
building with the abilitiy to have power within twenty (20) minutes of a power failure.  

Mayor Pond thanked the Board of Supervisors for their support of this project. 

This was presented for the Board’s information.
*****

Town of Lawrenceville – TEA-21 Grant 

Mayor Douglas R. Pond stated that the Town is submitting a TEA-21 grant to link the downtown sidewalks with the Tobacco Heritage Trail. He requested a letter of support from the Board of Supervisors for this project. 

Upon motion of Mr. Conner, seconded by Mr. Jones, and unanimously carried,

the Board approved a letter of support for the grant. 

Ayes:  Conner, Finney, Jones, Drummond; Nays: None. 

*****

Re:   Citizen Comments 

The Chairman opened the citizen comment period and advised that each citizen 

will be allotted three (3) minutes to speak. No citizens spoke. 

After giving all citizens an opportunity to express their views, the Chairman 

closed the Citizen Comment period. 

*****

Re:     Consent Calendar of Reports 

Upon motion of Mr. Conner, seconded by Mr. Jones, and unanimously 

carried, the Board approved the Consent Calendar of Reports as presented for the 

following organizations:

A.  Lawrenceville-Brunswick Airport Monthly Report – October 2009

B.  Roanoke River Service Authority Minutes – September 22, 2009
C.  Southside Community Services Board Minutes – September 15, 2009 

D.  Industrial Development Authority Minutes – October 13, 2009 

Ayes:  Conner, Finney, Jones, Drummond; Nays:  None.    

*****

Re: Brunswick County Public Schools - Monthly Report 


There was no report. 

*****

Re:  Finance Director’s Report

Approval of Disbursements 

Upon motion of Mr. Jones, seconded by Mr. Finney, and carried, the Board 

approved the disbursements in the total amount of $250,888.85 as follows: 

· system checks dated November 11, 2009, in the amount of $33,720.80 (utilities) 
· system checks dated November 18, 2009, in the amount of $197,878.93  

· system checks dated November 19, 2009, in the amount of $8,283.78 (election)
· system checks dated November 20, 2009, in the amount of $2,070.00 (jury)

· system checks dated November 23, 2009, in the amount of $8,935.34 

Ayes: Conner, Finney, Jones, Drummond; Nays: None.    

*****
Anthem Inmate Health Insurance Renewal   


Mrs. Alice Maitland, Treasurer, stated that the Board of Supervisors approved participation in the Anthem Medical Services Program, endorsed by the Virginia Sheriff’s Association on July 14, 1999. This plan allows the County to receive Anthem’s discounted services at participating health care providers, facilities, and pharmacies. 


Annual renewals have been based on fiscal year, but as of January 2010 renewal will be based on calendar year. The monthly prepayment amount for calendar year 2010 will be $5,700.00. This is a $600 per month increase over FY09 which is calculated based on the prior year’s actual claims expense. 


This program is part of the FY10 Brunswick Sheriff’s Office Corrections and Detention budget. 

 
Upon motion of Mr. Conner, seconded by Mr. Finney, and unanimously carried, the Board approved the renewal of the Anthem Inmate Health Insurance Contract for the period January 1, 2010, through December 31, 2010. 
 Ayes: Conner, Finney, Jones, Drummond; Nays: None.  
*****

Re:  County Administrator’s Report

County Administrator’s Monthly Report – October 2009


Ms. Woolridge, County Administrator, presented the County Administrator’s 
monthly report for October 2009.  
     
Upon motion of Mr. Finney, seconded by Mr. Jones, and unanimously carried, 
the Board approved the County Administrator’s monthly report as submitted. 

Ayes: Conner, Finney, Jones, Drummond; Nays:  None.

*****

Brunswick County Animal Shelter – Metal Coverings      

 Ms. Woolridge, County Administrator, stated that on June 17, 2009, the 
Brunswick County Animal Shelter was inspected by Sherry Helsel, LVT, Animal Pound & Shelter Inspector, Virginia Department of Agriculture and Consumer Services, to ensure compliance with the regulations as set forth by the Virginia Department of Agricultural and Consumer Services.  One area of non-compliance was identified as follows:

· The outdoor sections of the run enclosures were in use as a primary enclosure at the time of arrival. Several dogs did not have protection from rain and/or direct sunlight because the partition door was closed, preventing them from going inside. Because this section of the runs comprises part of the primary enclosure, the floors and walls must also have a surface quality that can be adequately disinfected. The porous concrete floor is not conducive to proper sanitation. 

Staff recommends constructing and erecting a metal covering over each section
of the outside runs. Bids were solicited in the local newspaper. No bids were received in response to this solicitation. As a result, staff contacted the following companies: 

· Steel Tube Buildings, Inc. 

$4,765.00 

· Newmart Builders


No bid  

· American Buildings, Inc.

No bid 

· Morton Buildings, Inc. 

No bid 

Funds are available in the FY10 Animal Control Budget to cover costs associated
with this project.  

Upon motion of Mr. Conner, seconded by Mr. Jones, and unanimously carried, 

the Board accepted the bid in the amount of $4,765.00 from Steel Tube Buildings, Inc. 
to construct and erect two metal coverings at the Brunswick County Animal Shelter 
contingent upon the estimate including installation costs and clarification of the gauge of 
metal for the coverings. 
Ayes: Conner, Finney, Jones, Drummond; Nays: None. 

*****
Albertis S. Harrison, Jr. Courthouse – Chemtreat, Inc. Service Agreement      

Ms. Woolridge, County Administrator, stated that during the construction of the 

Albertis S. Harrison, Jr. Courthouse, a chemical treatment system was installed by Chemtreat, Inc. to ensure proper functioning of the cooling towers for the HVAC system. As a result, a service agreement was approved with Chemtreat, Inc. to provide annual maintenance service. The contract has expired.  
 
A two year service agreement costs $1,651.38 annually.  Funding is included in the FY10 Buildings and Grounds Regular Maintenance Contract line item to cover the costs associated with this service agreement. 

Upon motion of Mr. Conner, seconded by Mr. Jones, and unanimously carried, the 

Board approved the two year service agreement with Chemtreat, Inc. for the chemical 

treatment system at the Albertis S. Harrison, Jr., Courthouse in the annual amount of 

$1,615.38. 

Ayes: Conner, Finney, Jones, Drummond; Nays:  None. 

*****

Albertis S. Harrison, Jr. Courthouse – Trane HVAC Contract Renewal  

Ms. Woolridge, County Administrator, stated that during the construction of the 

Albertis S. Harrison, Jr. Courthouse, an HVAC system was installed by Trane. As a result, a service agreement was approved with Trane to provide annual maintenance service. The contract has expired.  
 
A one year service agreement costs $11,196.00 annually.  Funding is included in the FY10 Buildings and Grounds Regular Maintenance Contract line item to cover the costs associated with this service agreement. 

Upon motion of Mr. Conner, seconded by Mr. Finney, and unanimously carried, the 

Board approved the one year service agreement with Trane for the HVAC system at the 

Albertis S. Harrison, Jr., Courthouse in the annual amount of $11,196.00. 

Ayes: Conner, Finney, Jones, Drummond; Nays:  None. 

*****

Old Brunswick County Courthouse – Cupola and Portico Area Structural 

Concerns

Ms. Woolridge, County Administrator, stated that Brunswick County was awarded 
a grant from the Virginia Department of Historic Resources to update the existing National Register nomination for the old courthouse and to prepare a physical conditions assessment report on the 1854 Brunswick County Courthouse Building. William and Mary Center for Archeological Research was commissioned by the Virginia Department of Historic Resources to conduct a condition assessment of the existing facility. The assessment identified urgent structural concerns in the cupola and the portico. It was recommended that the County secure the services of a structural engineer to inspect the building and formulate a program of remedial measures.  

Mr. Leon Morris, LVM Engineering, was contacted to perform an emergency 
inspection and to conduct an analysis of the old courthouse building.  Mr. Morris supports William and Mary’s findings.  


The following contractors were contacted to provide bids to construct and erect 
the entrance:


ThyssenKrupp Safway, Inc.

$2,802.00 (construct, erect, dismantle)








$320.00 monthly rental


Soutshide General Contractors

No bid


Carter Construction Company

No Bid


Wilson Contractors



No Bid 

Funds have been identified in the FY10 Buildings and Grounds Repair and 
Maintenance line item to cover costs associated with this project.  
Upon motion of Mr. Jones, seconded by Mr. Conner, and unanimously carried, 

the Board accepted the bid from ThyssenKrupp Safway, Inc. in the amount of $2,802.00 
to construct, erect and dismantle the scaffolding entrance and $320.00 per month rental 

with funds to be utilized from the FY10 Buildings and Grounds Repair and Maintenance  

Repair and Maintenance line item. 
Ayes: Conner, Finney, Jones, Drummond; Nays: None. 

*****

Re:  Old Business 

Director of Finance position 


Upon motion of Mr. Finney, seconded by Mr. Jones, and unanimously carried, the
Board rescinded the motion to hire Frank Milazi as Finance Director at Mr. Milazi’s 
request.
Ayes: Conner, Finney, Jones, Drummond; Nays: None. 

*****

Re:  New Business

Hotel Study 


Supervisor Conner requested a copy of the Hotel study. Ms. Woolridge stated that 

she will contact the Industrial Development Authority and request a copy for each Board 
member.  

*****

Re:  Appointments 

Lake Country Development Corporation


This item was continued.  
Ayes:  Conner, Finney, Jones, Drummond; Nays: None. 

*****

Brunswick County Committee of the Virginia Sesquicentennial of the Civil War 

Mr. Wilbert Starkes has submitted a letter of resignation. As a result, there is a
vacancy in the Totaro District.  

 
Upon motion of Mr. Jones, seconded by Mr. Finney, and unanimously carried, the 

Board appointed Cyliene Montgomery to serve on the Brunswick County Committee of 

the Virginia Sesquicentennial of the Civil War representing the Totaro District. 
 Ayes:  Conner, Finney, Jones, Drummond; Nays: None. 

*****
Re:   Adjourn
Upon motion of Mr. Jones, seconded by Mr. Finney, and unanimously carried, 

the Board adjourned. 
Ayes: Conner, Finney, Jones, Drummond; Nays:  None    

____________________________

____________________________
Barbara Jarrett Drummond, Chair


Charlette T. Woolridge, Clerk
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